- CITY OF ALLEN BID TABULATION SHEET
:‘ 2007-3-114

- RE-BID TEMPORARY PERSONNEL SERVICES ANNUAL CONTRACT
OPENED: APRIL 3, 2007 @ 2PM

CITY OF ALLEN
EXPRESS PEOPLE CORP
ANNEXUS PERSONNEL PERSONNEL PROFESSIONAL RESULTS STAFFING
SERVICES SERVICES STAFFING INC
# Position Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate
1 Receptionist $15.60 $15.12 $10.23 NO BID
2 Library Page/Clerk $12.48 $14.02 $9.66 NO BID
3 Adminstrative Asst. $18.72 16.23-17.33 $12.54 NO BID
4 Customer Service Rep $18.72 $16.23 $11.75 NO BID
5 Senior Administrative Assist. $20.28 $18.93-$20.03 $16.54 NO BID
6 Building Maintenance Tech NO BID $14.97-$17.66 $10.24 NO BID
7 Executive Secretary $20.28 $20.03-$21.14 $15.89 NO BID
8 Accounting Clerk $17.16 $16.23-$17.33 $10.96 NO BID
9 Senior Accounting Clerk $20.28 $20.03-$21.14 $12.21 NO BID
10 Maintenance Worker NO BID $14.97-$17.66 $9.96 $10.50
11 Custodian NO BID $13.74-$14.97 $9.96 $10.50

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS
SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY
ACCEPTS SUCH BIDS AS RESPONSIVE. THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED
UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS. INCLUDING BUT
NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON
AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.







