
CITY OF ALLEN BID TABULATION SHEET

QTY  GST

1 300 T-Shirt
 Navy 6.6 light 

steele 5.60 
 $1980.00 or 

$1680.00  $       6.35  $   1,905.00  $       7.48  $        2,244.00  $       7.25  $   2,175.00  $       7.55  $   2,265.00 $9.02 $2,706.00
Add  for XXL  $            1.25  $       2.00  $       1.00  $       2.00  $       1.62 $1.50
Add  for XXXL  $            2.00  $       2.00  $       2.00  $       2.50  $       2.52 $2.00
Add  for XXXXL 2.50 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.77 2.25

2 150 Jobshirt  $          48.50  $    7,275.00  $     44.45  $   6,681.00  $     30.50  $        4,575.00  no bid  no bid  $     42.95  $   6,442.50 $44.20 $6,630.00
Add  for XXL  $                -    $       5.00  $       3.00     $       4.30 $2.00
Add  for XXXL  $            2.00  $       7.00  $       5.00     $       8.60 $3.00
Add  for XXXXL  $            3.00  $       9.00  $       7.00     $     12.89 $4.00

3 100 Jersey Shorts  $            7.50  $       750.00  $       8.42  $      842.00  $       7.30  $          730.00  $     12.50  $   1,250.00  $       6.85  $      685.00 $8.25 $827.00
  Add  for XXL  $                -    $       2.00  $       1.00  $       2.00  $       1.39 $1.50

Add  for XXXL  $                -    $       4.00  $       2.00  $       3.00  $       2.39 N/A
Add  for XXXXL  $                -    $       7.00  $       3.00  $       4.00  $          -   N/A

4 100 Sweat Pants  $          10.75  $    1,075.00  $     14.98  $   1,498.00  $       9.49  $          949.00  11..50  $   1,150.00  $     10.95  $   1,095.00 $14.62 $1,462.00
Add  for XXL  $            2.50  $       2.00  $       2.00  $       2.00  $       2.87 $2.00
Ad for XXXL  $            2.50  $       6.00  $       4.00  $       3.00  $       5.08 N/A

  Add  for XXXXL  $                -    $       8.00  $       5.00  $       4.00  $          -   N/A

5 85
Men's Uniform 
Pants Waste 28-34  $          27.70  $    2,354.50  $     34.08  $   2,896.80  $     30.36  $        2,580.60  $     24.75  $   2,103.75  $     27.80  $   2,363.00 $40.24 $3,420.40
Add$______ for 
waist 35-42  $                -    $       3.00  $       1.00  $          -       $       2.20 $2.00
Add$______ size 
44-50  $                -    $       5.00  $       2.00  $       2.00  $       4.40 $4.40

6

Ladies Uniform 
Pants 4-20  $          27.70  $    2,354.50  $     34.08  $   2,896.80  $     30.36  $        2,580.60  $     24.75  $   2,103.00  $     27.80  $   2,363.00 No Bid No Bid
Add$______ size 
22-24  $                -   $3.00  $       1.00  $       2.00  $       3.30 

13,809.00$   16,719.60$ 13,659.20$     8,781.75$   15,213.50$ $15,045.40

2007-3-139 DAILY UNIFORM AND PT CLOTHING
OPENED 7/17/07 @ 2:00 PM

ADVISION UNIFORMS INC SIA TACTICAL GEAR SAFETY & SECURITY

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET.  HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED 
AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BIDS AS RESPONSIVE.   THE CITY WILL MAKE A 
DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND 
PROJECT DOCUMENTS.  INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER 
UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.



UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.


