
                                               City of Allen Bid Tabulation Sheet
             2007-8-272

                                                  REBID - Mosquito Control Products
                                      Opened: 9/26/07 @ 2:00pm

Description Est Qty Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost
Bactimos Briquets 100/pack 50 $53.80 $2,690.00 $116.44 $5,822.00 $76.00 $3,800.00 $54.44 $2,722.00
Abate 5% Pellets 10 no bid no bid $1,002.38 $10,023.80 no bid no bid $371.60 $3,716.00
Vectolex CG 10 no bid no bid $334.13 $3,341.30 no bid no bid $213.00 $2,130.00

TOTAL $2,690.00 $19,187.10 $3,800.00 $8,568.00

Delivery Days   1-2 days  7 Days  2-4 Days  2-7 Days

* Equivalent Brand Bid on item 2
** Equivalent Brand Bid on Item 1

**Univar USA DFW GROUP Adapco, Inc.
*B & G Chemicals & 
Equipment Co., Inc.

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET.  HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS SHEET 
SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH 
BIDS AS RESPONSIVE.   THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE 
WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS.  INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE 
PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT 
AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.

CITY OF ALLEN 
PURCHASING DIVISION


