
Bid Tabulation 
For Fitness Equipment for Don Rodenbaugh Natatorium & Joe Farmer Recreation Center  
Opened 10/10/07 
Bid # 2007-9-311 
 
Bids were received from the following:  

 
 

Don Rodenbaugh Natatorium Fitness Equipment (Part A Cardiovascular Equipment) 

BODY WORKS Unit 
Price 

Ext Price Delivery 
Days 

FITCO Unit 
Price  

Ext Price Delivery 
Days 

Treadmill per City of Allen 8 specifications or equal Model/Mfg. 
Bidding: 
True Fitness CS8.0 

 
$5,190.00 

 
$41,520.00 

 
30-45 

Treadmill per City of Allen 8 specifications or equal Model/Mfg. 
Bidding: 
Precon C956IES 

 
$4,720.00 

 
$38,000.00 

 
20 

5 year Extended warranty on 8 treadmills, per City of Allen 
specifications or equal Model/Mfg. Bidding: 
X  Warranty 2 addit. Yrs 

 
$900.00 

 
$7,200.00 

 
No bid 

5 year Extended warranty on 8 Treadmills, per City of Allen 
specifications or equal model/Mfg. Bidding: 
 

 
No bid 

 
No bid 

 
Included 

Installation costs for Natatorium equipment $3,200.00 Installation costs for Natatorium equipment $800.00 
Joe Farmer Recreation Center Fitness Equipment (Part B Cardiovascular Equipment) 

VersaClimber, per City of Allen 1 specifications or equal 
Model/Mfg. idding: 
108 SM 

 
$3,995.00 

 
$3,995.00 

 
30-45 

VersaClimber, per City of Allen 1 specifications or equal 
Model/Mfg. Bidding: 
 

 
No bid 

 
No bid 

 
No bid 

CardioTheater x-TV9(r), per City of Allen 7 Specifications or equal 
Model/Mfg. Bidding: 
MYE MWC -9 wireles controller 

 
$144.00 

 
$1,008.00 

 
30-45 

CardioTheater x-TV9(r), per City of Allen  
7 Specifications or equal Model/Mfg. Bidding: 
 

 
$125.10 

 
$875.70 

 
20 

Extended Warranty for CardioTheater 7  
x-TV9(r), per City of Allen Specifications or equal Model/Mfg. 
Bidding 
X Warranty 3 yrs total 

 
$101.00 

 
$707.00 

 
30-45 

Extended Warranty for CardioTheater 7      
x-TV9(r), per City of Allen Specifications or equal Model/Mfg. 
Bidding 
 

 
 

$15.00 

 
 

$105.00 

 
 

No bid 

CardioTheater x-TV9(t),6 per City of Allen Specifications or equal 
Model/Mfg. BiddingMYE MWT – 59 5 single  
channel transmitter Warranty 1 yr 

 
$315.00 

 
$1,890.00 

 
30-45 

CardioTheater x-TV9(t), 6 per City of Allen Specifications or 
equal Model/Mfg. Bidding MYE MWT – 59 5 single  
 

 
$359.10 

 
$2,154.60 

 
20 

Extended Warranty for x-TV9(t), 6 per City of Allen Specifications 
or equal Model/Mfg. Bidding: 
X Warranty 5 yrs total  

 
$222.00 

 
$1,332.00 

 
30-45 

Extended Warranty for x-TV9(t), 6  per City of Allen 
Specifications or equal Model/Mfg. Bidding: 
 

 
$35.00 

 
$210.00 

 
No bid 

CardioTheater xTV-FMT FM Transmitters, per City of 
AllenSpecifications or equalModel/Mfg. Bidding: 
MYE  MFM T 

 
 

$170.00 

 
 

$340.00 

 
 

30-45 

CardioTheater xTV-FMT FM Transmitters, per City of 
AllenSpecifications or equal Model/Mfg. Bidding: 

 
$269.10 

 
$538.20 

 
20 

AM/FM Receiver, per City of Allen 1  
Specifications or equal Model/Mfg. Bidding: 

 
No bid 

 
No bid 

 
No bid 

AM/FM Receiver, per City of Allen 1  
Specifications or equalModel/Mfg. Bidding:  

 
$199.00 

 
$199.00 

 
20 

 
Installation costs for Recreation Center equipment $1280.00 Installation costs for Recreation Center equipment $575.00 

 
ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET.  HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE 
CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE. 
 
THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN 
PURCHASING GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS.  INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL 
NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTACT AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME. 
 
PURCHASING DIVISION  
CITY OF ALLEN, TEXAS 


