
                                                                      2008-10-03
                                                                      2008-10-03
                                               Printer Supplies & Maintenance Annual Contract
                                                               Opened: 10/17/07 @ 2pm

Description Printer Medic Computer 
Connect Plus

TCS Corporate 
Services Laser Works All Pro 

Technology
Electronic Risk 

Consultants

Click Count - Color 60,622 (per page) $0.1000 $0.1400 $0.1804 $0.1050 $0.1050
Click Count - Black & White 946,378 (per page) $0.0140 $0.0170 $0.0167 $0.0165 $0.0220
Total Monthly Cost $1,609.00 $1,650.21 $2,047.96 $2,228.60 $1,831.71 $2,265.47
Total Annual Cost $19,311.00 $19,802.53 $24,575.51 $26,743.14 $21,980.54 $27,185.64

Optional Bid for 3 IBM Printers
Total Monthly Cost $390.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $239.25
Total Annual cost $4,680.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $2,871.00Total Annual cost $4,680.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $2,871.00
Service call response time (hours) 8 8 8 8 8 8
Acknowledge addendum #1 yes no no yes yes yes

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET.  HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS SHEET 
SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH 
BIDS AS RESPONSIVE.   THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH 
ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS.  INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT 
SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND 
ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.

CITY OF ALLEN 
PURCHASING DIVISION
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