
BID TABULATION SHEET  
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER,  
MOUND CLAY AND QUICK DRY 
2008-10-11 
Opened 11/21/07 
 
 

 
ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET.  HOWEVER E LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT 
BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BIDS AS RESPONSIVE.   
THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE 
LAWSCITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS.  INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND 
CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND ACCORDING TO LAWALL BIDS 
RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR  
INSPECTION AT THAT TIME. 
 
CITY OF ALLEN 
PURCHASING DIVISION 

 
 

Company Name UAP Justin Seed Co Greensmith Sports Supply Group BWI 

 
Item 

Description 

 
Quantity 

 
PER 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Extended 

Price 

 
Unit Price 

 
Extended 

Price 

 
Unit Price 

 
Extended 

Price 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Extended 

Price 

 
- 

 
N/A 

 
 
16-3-4 

 
 
80 Tons 

 
50lb Bag 

 
$12.60 

 
$40,320.00 

 
$16.20 

 
$51,840.00 

 
- 

 
- 

 
No bid 

 
- 

  
N/A 

 
Ton 

 
$504.00 

 
$40,320.00 

 
$626.00 

 
$50,080.00 

 
$500.00 

 
$40,000.00 

 
No bid 

 
- 

-  
N/A 

 
 
21-0-0 

 
 
37 Tons 

 
50lb Bag 

 
$9.50 

 
$14,060.00 

 
$8.88 

 
$13,142.40 

 
- 

 
- 

 
No bid 

 
- 

-  
N/A 

 
Ton 

 
$380.00 

 
$14,060.00 

 
$333.00 

 
$12,321.00 

 
$400.00 

 
$14,800.00 

 
No bid 

 
- 

-  
N/A 

 
 
15-5-10 

 
 
70 Ton 

 
50lb Bag 

 
$13.00 

 
$36,400.00 

 
$10.18 

 
$28,504.00 

 
- 

 
- 

 
No bid 

 
- 

-  
N/A 

 
Ton 

 
$520.00 

 
$36,400.00 

 
$386.02 

 
$27,020.00 

 
$480.00 

 
$33,600.00 

 
No bid 

 
- 

-  
N/A 

 
 
20-4-8 

 
 
10 Tons 

 
50lb Bag 

 
$12.25 

 
$4,900.00 

 
$10.525 

 
$4,210.00 

 
- 

 
- 

 
No bid 

 
- 

-  
N/A 

 
Ton 

 
$490.00 

 
$4,900.00 

 
$404.00 

 
$4,040.00 

 
$450.00 

 
$4,600.00 

 
No bid 

 
- 

-  
N/A 

  
Mound Clay 

 
18,000 lbs 

 
50lb Bag 

 
no bid 

 
- 

 
- 

 
No bid 

 
$12.50 

 
$4,500.00 

 
$489.88 

 
$4,408.92 

 
$7.60 

 
$2,736.00 

 
Quick Dry 

 
28,000 lbs 

 
50lb Bag 

 
no bid 

 
- 

 
- 

 
No bid 

 
$8.50 

 
$4,760.00 

 
$541.82 

 
$7,585.48 

 
8.00 

 
$4,480 


