A']

CITY OF ALLEN

City of Allen Bid Taublation Sheet

Annual Contract for Medical Supplies

2008-10-28
Opened 1/9/08 @ 2pm

MEDICAL PRODUCTS
SUPPLY

BOUNDTREE MEDICAL,
LLC

INTERBORO
PACKAGING CORP

SOUTHEASTERN
EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANIM HEALTH
SERVICES, INC.

HENRY SCHEIN MATRX
MEDICAL

MOORE MEDICAL

QUAD MED, INC.

Item #

Est.
OTY.

Description

Unit
Cost

Ext Cost

Unit
Cost

Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

IV Drip tubing 2 Y
sites (interlink sys.)

10drops/ml 101" 1500ea

Baxter #2C6425

no bid

no bid

$3.28 $4,920.00]no bid no bid

$96.00 $4,500.00

$2.07 $3,105.00

$2.59 $3,885.00)

$2.71 $4,065.00)

$1.54 $2,310.00

IV Drip Tubing 2 Y
sites (Interlink sys)

60drops/ml 90"
Baxter #2C6424

500ea

no bid

no bid

$3.60 $1,800.00fno bid no bid

$2.50 $1,250.00

$2.47 $1,235.00]

$2.93 $1,465.00]

$2.79 $1,395.00)

$2.09 $1,045.00

Alcohol IV Prep
Pads

2 ply medium 70%
alcohol (bx/200)

50bx

no bid

no bid

$1.50 $75.00]no bid no bid

$1.25 $62.50

$1.38 $69.00]

$1.26 $63.00|

$1.28 $64.00

$1.29 $64.50

Compound Bezoin
Tincture USP 10%

swabstick 50/box 6bx

by PDI

no bid

no bid

$10.07 $60.42]no bid no bid

$8.50 $51.00

$11.12 $66.72

$8.09 $48.54

$7.71 $46.26

$9.38 $56.28

Tourniquet

Disposable Latex | 1000ea

Free

no bid

no bid

$0.18326 $183.26]no bid no bid

$0.09 $90.00

$0.09 $90.00|

$0.11 $110.00

$1.24 $124.00

$0.09 $90.00

Padded IV arm
Board (disposable)

3"x18" 200ea

no bid

no bid

$0.65 $130.00]no bid no bid

$0.80 $160.00

$0.49 $98.00

$0.77 $154.00

$4.79 $162.86

$0.56 $112.00

Povidone lodine
Prep Pads

Medium, (box/100) | 15bx

no bid

no bid

$3.65 $54.75[no bid no bid

$3.10 $46.50

$3.26 $48.90

$2.43 $36.45

$2.42 $36.30

$3.09 $46.35

Protectiv I.V. Plus
Cath. 3068

14G x 1.25"
(box/50)

15 bx

$86.75

$1,301.25

$121.00 $1,815.00]no bid no bid

$94.50 $1,417.50

$94.50 $1,417.50]

$89.79 $1,346.85]

$103.21 $1,548.15

$92.50 $1,387.50

Protectiv I.V. Plus
Cath. 3062

16G x 1.25%
(box/50)

15 bx

$86.75

$1,301.25

$121.00 $1,815.00]no bid no bid

$94.50 $1,417.50

$94.50 $1,417.50

$89.52 $1,342.80

$99.11 $1,486.65

$92.50 $1,387.50

10

Protectiv I.V. Plus
Cath. 3065

18G x 1.25%
(box/50)

25 bx

$68.75

$2,168.75]

$121.00 $3,025.00]no bid no bid

$94.50 $2,362.50

$94.50 $2,362.50]

$91.83 $2,295.75]

$99.11 $2,477.75

$92.50 $2,312.25

11

Protectiv V. Plus
Cath. 3066

20G x 1.25"
(box/50)

20 bx

$86.75

$1,735.00

$121.00 $2,420.00]no bid no bid

$94.50 $1,890.00

$94.50 $1,890.00

$91.38 $1,827.60

$99.11 $1,982.20

$92.50 $1,850.00

12

Protectiv I.V. Plus
Cath. 3060

22G x 1" (box/50) 10 bx

$86.75

$867.50

$121.00 $1,210.00]no bid no bid

$94.50 $945.00

$94.50 $945.00

$92.72 $927.20

$99.11 $991.10

$92.50 $925.00




MEDICAL PRODUCTS
SUPPLY

BOUNDTREE MEDICAL,

LLC

INTERBORO
PACKAGING CORP

SOUTHEASTERN
EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANIM HEALTH
SERVICES, INC.

HENRY SCHEIN MATRX
MEDICAL

MOORE MEDICAL
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OTY.
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Unit Cost
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13

Protectiv V. Plus
Cath. 30630
24G x .75" (box/50)

10 bx

$88.00

$880.00

$121.00

$1,210.00

no bid no bid

$94.50 $945.00

$99.00 $990.00

$92.51 $925.10

$103.83 $1,038.30

$92.50

$925.00

14

Intraosseous
Needles Baxter
#1518X

18G adjustable len.|
1/16" -1 7/16"

20ea

no bid

no bid

$9.66

$193.20

no bid no bid

$8.00 $160.00

$14.39 $287.80

$10.04 $200.80

$12.51 $250.20

$9.29

$185.80

15

Intraosseous
Needles Baxter
#1515X

15G adjustable len.
3/8" - 17/8"

20ea

no bid

no bid

$9.66

$193.20

no bid no bid

$8.00 $160.00

$13.96 $278.20

$9.96 $199.20

$12.36 $247.20

$9.41

$188.20

16

Syringe 3cc Luer
Lock (bx/100)

3 bx

no bid

no bid

$6.41

$19.23

no bid no bid

$5.60 $16.80

$5.54 $16.62

$5.31 $15.93

$10.29 $30.87

$7.29

$21.87

17

Syringe 5-6¢c Luer
Lock (bx/100)

3 bx

no bid

no bid

$11.83

$35.49

no bid no bid

$10.00 $30.00

$5.24 $15.72

$10.04 $30.12

$18.19 $54.57

$9.21

$27.63

18

Syringe 10-12cc
Luer Lock( bx/100)

3 bx

no bid

no bid

$13.18

$39.54

no bid no bid

$10.50 $31.50

$8.74 $26.22

$9.98 $29.94]

$19.49 $58.47

$10.89

$32.67

19

Syringe 20-25cc
Luer Lock (bx/100)

3 bx

no bid

no bid

$34.28

$102.84

no bid no bid

$14.80 $44.40

$15.68 $47.04

$28.05 $84.15

$26.79 $160.74

$7.80

$23.40

20

Syringe 30-35cc
Luer Lock (bx/100)

3 bx

no bid

no bid

$42.00

$126.00

no bid no bid

$17.65 $52.95

$11.60 $34.80

$33.45 $100.35

$30.19 $241.52

$10.05

$30.15

21

Syringe 1cc TB
25G x 5/8" (bx/100),

3 bx

no bid

no bid

$13.00

$39.00

no bid no bid

$8.15 $24.45

$10.71 $32.13

$5.02 $15.06

$16.69 $50.07

no bid

22

Syringe 60cc Cath
Tip BD#309620

50ea

no bid

no bid

$0.61

$30.50

no bid no bid

$35.10 $70.20

$0.5575 $27.88

$0.80 $40.00|

$14.09 $42.27

$12.8300

$641.50

23

Hypodermic
Needles (bx/100)
21G x 11/2"

3 bx

no bid

no bid

$5.11

$15.33

no bid no bid

$3.25 $9.75]

$4.54 $13.62

$3.09 $9.27

$13.39 $40.17

$4.12

$12.36

24

Hypodermic
Needles (bx/100)
25G x 5/8"

3 bx

no bid

no bid

$5.11

$15.33

no bid no bid

$3.25 $9.75

$4.54 $13.62

$3.16 $9.48

$13.39 $40.17

$4.12

$12.36

25

Twinpak Dual
cannula device
bx/100

25 bx

no bid

no bid

$45.00

$1,125.00

no bid no bid

$37.80 $945.00

no bid

$35.90 $897.50

no bid

$43.95

$1,098.75

26

Ascentia Elite

Blood Glucose
Test Strips (bx/50)

50 bx

no bid

no bid

$29.00

$1,450.00

no bid no bid

$24.15 $1,207.50

$25.00 $1,250.00

$21.50 $1,075.00]

$55.28 $2,764.00

$26.00

$1,300.00

27

Lifescan Unistick 2

Lancing Devices wi|
100 lancets/bx

10bx

no bid

no bid

$22.88

$228.80

no bid no bid

no bid

$16.46 $164.60

$13.94 $139.40

no bid

$18.65

$186.50

28

Emesis Basin
(Kidney Pan
plastic)

9in 500 cc capacity

200ea

no bid

no bid

$0.23

$46.00

no bid no bid

$0.15 $30.00

$0.14 $28.00

$0.08 $16.00|

$0.09 $18.00

$0.12

$24.00

29

6 quart Wash

Basins (plastic)

200ea

no bid

no bid

$0.66

$132.00

no bid no bid

$0.55 $110.00

$0.88 $176.00

$0.55 $110.00

$0.61 $122.00

$0.89

$178.00




MEDICAL PRODUCTS|BOUNDTREE MEDICAL, INTERBORO SOUTHEASTERN TRI-ANIM HEALTH HENRY SCHEIN MATRX
SUPPLY LLC PACKAGING CORP EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT SERVICES, INC. MEDICAL MOORE MEDICAL QUAD MED, INC.
Item # Description Est. Unit Ext Cost Unit Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost
oTY Cost Cost_
30 |EKG Electrodes SUDXs
per cs
"Silvon 15cs
Diaphoretics" . . . .
Conmed (bx/40) no bid no bid $267.90 $4,018.50fno bid no bid $8.00 $3,600.00 $240.00 $3,600.00] $11.60 $174.00 $9.04 $180.80 $169.50 $2,542.25
31 |Sta-blok head 30cs
immobilizers . : . .
(case/30) no bid no bid $129.90 $3,897.00fno bid no bid $3.95 $3,555.00 $133.50 $4,005.00 $131.71 $3,951.30] $3.47 $3,123.00 $165.90 $4,977.00
32 4x4?sterile 4 ply 10 cs . . . i i
NU Gauze no bid no bid $45.60 $456.00fno bid no bid no bid $41.70 $417.00 $33.61 $336.10 $47.28 $472.80 $44.40 $444.00
33 |2 sokaIing non- 10 cs . . . i
sterile no bid no bid $10.16 $101.60fno bid no bid $1.10 $88.00) $7.41 $74.10 $6.41 $64.10 $11.04 $110.40 $8.64 $86.40
34 Fsof—kling non- 10 cs . . . i
sterile no bid no bid $13.12 $131.20fno bid no bid $1.50 $120.00 $11.27 $112.70 $11.93 $119.30 $59.92 $599.20 $11.44 $114.40
35 Esof—kling non- 10 cs . . . i
sterile no bid no bid $13.44 $134.40]no bid no bid $1.50 $120.00 $10.30 $103.00 $9.21 $92.10 $54.32 $543.20 $11.12 $111.20
36 'ﬁiangular 100 bx
bandages . . . .
40"%40"X56" no bid no bid $4.00 $400.00]no bid no bid $0.21 $252.00 $2.88 $288.00 $2.16 $216.00 $1.25 $125.00 $2.20 $220.00
37 |Burn Sheets sterile] 2cs . . . i
no bid no bid $42.84 $85.68[no bid no bid $2.75 $66.00 $144.00 $288.00 $43.26 $86.52 $63.48 $126.96 $110.00 $220.00
38 |Vaseline gauze 4 bx . . . .
3x9 no bid no bid $38.00 $152.00fno bid no bid $0.55 $26.40 $7.08 $28.32 $34.01 $136.04 $58.08 $232.32 $7.65 $30.60
39 [Multitrauma 4cs
dressings 12"x30"
sterile 9 no bid no bid $32.25 $129.00]no bid no bid $1.20 $240.00 $24.00 $96.00 $22.26 $89.04 $19.25 $77.00 $52.00 $208.00
20 |Band-aids 1'’x3" | 50bx _ ) _ _
bx/100 no bid no bid $2.83 $141.50]no bid no bid $1.15 $57.50 $1.26 $63.00 $1.05 $52.50 $1.11 $55.50 $1.39 $69.50
41 |OB Soft Pack lcs [no bid no bid $58.20 $58.20]no bid no bid $4.30 $43.00 $46.00 $46.00 $50.11 $50.11 $4.39 $43.90 $40.00 $40.00
42 |Baby bunting 25ea |no bid no bid $4.00 $100.00]no bid no bid $3.55 $88.75 $4.78 $119.50 $3.13 $78.25|no bid $4.32 $108.00
43 |Tape Dermicel
Cloth:
1" hypo allergenic 2cs . . . .
bx/12 no bid no bid $98.76 $197.52]no bid no bid $6.75 $162.00 $92.76 $185.52 $76.93 $153.86 $87.24 $174.48 $110.00 $220.00
44 |Tape
hypoallergenic
Clear
1" bx/12 2cs  |no bid no bid $82.68 $165.36]no bid no bid $6.50 $156.00 $75.48 $150.96 $73.81 $147.62 $74.28 $148.56 $65.60 $131.20
45 |Tape Dermicel
Cloth
2" hypo allergenic 2cs . . . i
bx/6 no bid no bid $98.76 $197.52]no bid no bid $6.75 $162.00 $92.76 $185.52 $76.93 $153.86 $86.64 $173.28 $110.00 $220.00
46 [Veniguards: Adult 2c¢s  |no bid no bid $205.00 $410.00fno bid no bid $40.00 $400.00 $224.70 $449.40 $222.91 $445.82 $479.88 $959.76 $165.00 $330.00
47 |Cavicide 20ea
Disinfectant, Gallon . . . .
Refill no bid no bid $19.46 $389.20]no bid no bid $15.25 $305.00 $18.50 $370.00 $14.36 $287.20 $24.19 $483.80 $19.35 $387.00
48 |O2 Regulator with
2 DISS ports
Similar to 10ea . . . .
Spectrum 5550p no bid no bid $72.15 $721.50]no bid no bid $124.00 $1,240.00 $54.50 $545.00 $87.54 $875.40 $113.00 $1,130.00 $69.50 $695.00
49 |02 Cylinder D-size | 10ea
with toggle valve no bid no bid $52.52 $525.20]no bid no bid $37.50 $375.00 $48.00 $480.00 $39.22 $392.20 $41.94 $419.40 $39.00 $390.00
50 [Replacement 20ea
toggle and pin set
for O2 regulator no bid no bid $3.15 $63.00fno bid no bid $4.25 $85.00]no bid $5.21 $104.20]no bid $6.75 $135.00
51 JO2 NRB Adult 25 cs . . X X
masks no bid no bid $54.00 $1,350.00fno bid no bid $0.83 $1,037.50 $40.50 $1,012.50] $42.01 $1,050.25) $47.00 $1,175.00 $34.00 $850.00
52 OE\JRB Pediactric] 10cs . . X X
masks no bid no bid $74.50 $745.00]no bid no bid $1.05 $525.00 $56.50 $565.00 $54.51 $545.10 $53.00 $530.00 $47.00 $470.00




MEDICAL PRODUCTS

SUPPLY

BOUNDTREE MEDICAL,
LLC

INTERBORO
PACKAGING CORP

SOUTHEASTERN
EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

TRI-ANIM HEALTH
SERVICES, INC.

HENRY SCHEIN MATRX
MEDICAL

MOORE MEDICAL

QUAD MED, INC.

Item #

Description

Est.
OTY.

Unit
Cost

Ext Cost

Unit
Cost

Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit Cost Ext Cost

Unit

Cost Ext Cost

53

Nasal Cannulas
Adult

4cs

no bid

no bid

$20.00 $80.00

no bid no bid

$0.26 $52.00

$15.00 $60.00

$15.01 $60.04

$15.50 $62.00

$15.30

$61.20

54

Nasal Cannulas
Pediactric

no bid

no bid

$86.50 $173.00

no bid no bid

$0.96 $96.00

$24.50 $49.00

$37.01 $74.02

$30.50 $61.00

$17.50

$35.00

55

Hand Held
Nebulizer
(complete)
Micromist by
Hudson

no bid

no bid

$49.00 $196.00

no bid no bid

$1.40 $280.00

$35.50 $142.00

$81.51 $326.04

$46.50 $186.00

$46.50

$186.00

56

Diposable
Humidifiers

no bid

no bid

$70.50 $70.50

no bid no bid

$1.20 $60.00

$18.36 $18.36

$62.01 $62.01

$54.00 $54.00

$67.50

$67.50

57

BVMs Disposable :
Adult

Ambu Spur Il
(12/case)

15¢cs

no bid

no bid

$116.40 $1,746.00

no bid no bid

$10.60 $1,908.00

$109.32 $1,639.80)

$102.49 $1,537.35]

$102.60 $1,539.00

$135.24

$2,028.60

58

BVMs Disposable :
Pediatric,

Ambu Spur Il
(12/case)

10cs

no bid

no bid

$126.00 $1,260.00

no bid no bid

$16.50 $1,980.00

$140.40 $1,404.00]

$131.29 $1,312.90]

$136.08 $1,360.08

$160.56

$1,605.60

59

BVMs Disposable :
Infant

Ambu Spur Il
(12/case)

no bid

no bid

$126.00 $630.00

no bid no bid

$16.50 $990.00

$140.40 $702.00

$147.85 $739.25

$136.08 $680.40

$160.56

$802.80

60

Stylets
Adult/Child/Infant:

Disposable

150ea

no bid

no bid

$1.94 $291.00

no bid no bid

$2.90 $1,305.00

$1.95 $292.50

$2.78 $417.00

$4.84

$4.30 $1,371.00]

$2.10 $315.00

61

Sharps 1qt, Red

70ea

no bid

no bid

$1.55 $108.50

no bid no bid

$2.05 $143.50

$1.88 $131.60

$1.31 $91.70

$1.20 $84.00

$1.22 $85.40

62

Sharps 5.4 gt
Becton Dickinson
red 305517 cs/20

5cs

no bid

no bid

$115.60 $578.00

no bid no bid

$105.00 $525.00

$111.20 $556.00

$91.21 $456.05

$99.80 $499.00

no bid

63

Technol Fluid
Shield with visor

10 bx

no bid

no bid

$25.09 $250.90

no bid no bid

$24.65 $246.50

$22.62 $226.20

$20.40 $204.00

$8.51 $85.10

no bid

64

Pyramex: Eye
protection:

blue frame/clear
lens

100ea

no bid

no bid

$5.56 $556.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$3.36 $336.00

$3.35 $335.00

$1.61 $161.00

no bid

65

Pyramex N95
Mask universal
Size

6 bx

no bid

no bid

$22.63 $135.78

no bid no bid

no bid

$9.62 $57.72

$7.37 $44.22

$16.78 $100.68

no bid

66

Personal
Protective
gown:Medline

no bid

no bid

$56.25 $112.50

no bid no bid

$0.28

$99.20 $198.40

$11.11 $22.22

$8.32 $16.64

no bid

67

Saf-T-Seal
Isolation Bags 7-10

gal

20 bx

no bid

no bid

$33.90 $678.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$44.00 $880.00

$26.70 $534.00

$4.36 $87.20

no bid

68

Baxstrap Spine
Board/with dept

name
m——

10ea

no bid

no bid

$157.52 $1,575.20

no bid no bid

$134.00 $1,340.00

$122.35 $1,223.50]

$111.89 $1,118.90]

$247.01 $2,470.10

no bid
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69

BP cuffs
Adult/Child/Infant

10ea

no bid

no bid

$8.57 $85.70

no bid no bid

$58.50,

$66.50, $66.50 $191.50

$6.48,
$7.10

$135.80

$14.10 $141.00

$139.00 $1,390.00)

$6.56 $65.60

70

Spider Straps

6ea

no bid

no bid

$67.86 $407.16

no bid no bid

$63.50 $381.00

$63.49

$380.94

$44.54 $267.24

$94.09 $564.54

$74.00 $444.00

71

Purple Nitrile
Gloves: (safeskin)
Medium

10cs

no bid

no bid

$77.00 $770.00

$52.00 $520.00

$72.00 $720.00

$73.40

$734.00

$78.01 $780.10

$76.10 $761.00

$68.50 $685.00

Large

35cs

no bid

no bid

$77.00 $2,695.00

$52.00| $1,820.00

$72.00 $2,520.00

$73.40

$2,569.00)

$78.01 $2,730.35

$7.47 $2,614.50

$68.50 $2,397.50

X-Large

20 cs

no bid

no bid

$77.00 $1,540.00

$52.00| $1,040.00

$72.00 $1,440.00

$73.40

$1,468.00|

$78.01 $1,560.20)

$7.47 $1,494.00

$68.50 $1,370.00

72

Diposalble Cervical
collars

Ambu Perfit Ace
(Adjustable)

1000ea

no bid

no bid

$4.98 $4,980.00

no bid no bid

$5.30 $5,300.00

$4.70

$4,700.00

$5.17 $5,170.00

$5.26 $5,260.00

$4.85 $4,850.00

Ambu Perfit Mini
Ace (Adjustable)

500ea

no bid

no bid

$4.98 $2,490.00

no bid no bid

$5.30 $2,650.00

$4.70

$2,350.00

$5.16 $2,580.00

$5.25 $2,625.00

$4.85 $2,425.00

73

Adenocard

6ma/2ml
2mL Vial

20ea

no bid

no bid

$12.50 $250.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$29.10

$582.00

$36.52 $730.40

no bid

no bid

74

Adenocard
12mg/4ml vial

25ea

no bid

no bid

$21.00 $525.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$54.28

$1,357.00

$66.28 $1,657.00

no bid

no bid

75

Albuterol Sulfate
0.083%

3mL Unit Dose Vial
(bx/25)

8bx

no bid

no bid

$4.95 $39.60

no bid no bid

no bid

$3.75

$30.00]

$3.10 $24.80

no bid

no bid

76

Aminophyline 500
mg vial

40ea

no bid

no bid

$1.25 $50.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$0.90

$36.00|

$1.84 $73.60

no bid

no bid

7

Ativan
(Lorazepam)
2ma/lml___10/box

8bx

no bid

no bid

$16.50 $132.00

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid

$7.81 $62.48

no bid

no bid

78

Baby Asprin 36ct
bottle

20ea

no bid

no bid

$0.81 $16.20

no bid no bid

no bid

$0.92

$18.40

$0.58 $11.60

$0.51 $25.50

no bid

79

Atropine Sulfate

1mg (0.1mg/mL)
10mL Stickguard
syringe

50ea

no bid

no bid

$1.67 $83.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.43

$121.50

$3.13 $156.50

no bid

no bid

80

Atrovent
(Ipratropium
Bromide)
0.5mg/2.5ml

60ea

no bid

no bid

$0.205 $12.30

no bid no bid

no bid

$0.158

$9.48

$0.120 $7.20]

no bid

no bid

81

Calcium Chloride
10% (100ma /mL)
10mL Stickguard
syringe

20ea

no bid

no bid

$1.67 $33.40

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.56

$51.20]

$7.15 $143.00

no bid

no bid

82

Amiaoderone
150ma
3mL Ampule

40ea

no bid

no bid

$3.50 $140.00

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid

$1.88 $75.20

no bid

no bid

83

Dextrose injection
50% (500mg/mL)

50mL Stickguard

syringe

50ea

no bid

no bid

$1.85 $92.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$3.35

$167.50

$7.39 $369.50

no bid

no bid
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84

Dextrose injection,
25% (250mg/mL)

10mL Luerjet
Syringe

20ea

no bid

no bid

$2.20 $44.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.74 $54.80

$4.28 $85.60

$2.42 $48.40

no bid

85

Diazapam 10 mg
DEA C-IV
(10ma/2mL)
Bx/25

4bx

no bid

no bid

$61.25 $245.00

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid

$54.66 $218.64

no bid

no bid

86

Diphenhydramine
HCL 50ma
(50mg/mL) 1mL
Vial

100ea

no bid

no bid

$0.95 $95.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$1.16 $116.00

$2.12 $212.00

no bid

no bid

87

Dopamine 400mg
(40ma/mL)
10mL Vial

25ea

no bid

no bid

$0.95 $23.75

no bid no bid

no bid

$0.79 $19.75

$0.68 $17.00

no bid

no bid

88

Enalaprilat
1.25mg/1ml vial

40ea

no bid

no bid

$3.15 $126.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.05 $82.00]

$2.47 $98.80

no bid

no bid

89

Epinephrine

injection 1:10,000
(0.1mg/mL) 10mL
Stickguard syringe

100ea

no bid

no bid

$1.67 $167.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.43 $243.00

$3.22 $322.00

no bid

no bid

90

Epinephrine
injection 1:1000
(Img/mL) 1mL
Ample

100ea

no bid

no bid

$0.44 $44.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$1.18 $118.00

$3.38 $338.00

$11.69 $46.76

no bid

91

Epinephrine
injection 1:1000
(Img/mL) 30mL
Vial

50ea

no bid

no bid

$4.15 $207.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$3.12 $156.00

$3.06 $153.00

$3.64 $182.00

no bid

92

Fentanyl
0.05mg/ml 2ml vial
25/box

12bx

no bid

no bid

$25.50 $306.00

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid

$17.25 $207.00

no bid

no bid

93

Furosemide 40mg
(10ma/mL)
4mL Ansyr Syringe

50ea

no bid

no bid

$2.65 $132.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.43 $121.50

$2.18 $109.00

no bid

no bid

94

Glucagon 1mg Lilly
kit red box

40ea

no bid

no bid

$105.00 $4,200.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$134.00 $5,360.00

$91.30 $3,652.00

no bid

no bid

95

Ipecac Syrup 1
ounce(30mL)

20ea

no bid

no bid

$2.15 $43.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.50 $50.00

$1.52 $30.40

$1.71 $34.20

no bid

96

Glutose 15 gram
unit (oral)

20ea

no bid

no bid

$3.75 $75.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$3.50 $70.00

$2.98 $59.60

$8.95 $62.65

$3.15 $63.00

97

Haldol (haloperidol)
5mg/1ml vial

50ea

no bid

no bid

$3.15 $157.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$3.60 $180.00

$2.27 $113.50

no bid

no bid

98

Labetalol
100mag/20ml vial

50ea

no bid

no bid

$4.95 $247.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$1.87 $93.50

$3.67 $183.50

no bid

no bid

99

Lactated Ringers
1000 cc IV bag
14/cs

60cs

no bid

no bid

$31.22 $1,873.20

no bid no bid

no bid

$17.16 $1,029.60

$14.99 $899.40

$25.48 $1,528.80

no bid

100

Sodium Chloride
0.9% (Normal
Saline)
1000mL/bag
(baxter viaflex bag)

90cs

no bid

no bid

$24.22 $2,179.80

no bid no bid

no bid

$15.93 $1,433.70

$11.77 $1,059.30

$13.80 $1,242.00

no bid

no bid
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Sodium Chloride
0.9% NS 250 cc

bag 36/case

6cs

no bid

no bid

$61.56

$369.36

no bid no bid

no bid

$32.56 $195.36

$26.65 $159.90

$20.16 $181.44

no bid

102

Sodium Chloride
0.9% NS 12cc
flush

200ea

no bid

no bid

$0.60

$120.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$0.58 $116.00

$0.64 $128.00

no bid

no bid

103

Sodium Chloride
Irrigation 250 cc

240ea

no bid

no bid

$2.29

$549.60

no bid no bid

no bid

$1.10 $264.00

$0.97 $232.80

$1.42 $340.80

no bid

104

LidocaineHCL 2%
(20ma/mL)

5mL Stickguard
syringe

100ea

no bid

no bid

$1.67

$167.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.43 $243.00

$5.29 $529.00

no bid

no bid

105

LidocaineHCL
1%(10ma/ml)
5ml Ansyr Syringe

20ea

no bid

no bid

$2.42

$48.40

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.16 $43.20

$2.79 $55.80

no bid

no bid

106

Lidocaine HCL and
5% Dextrose
2grams (0.4%)
500mL

50 ea

no bid

no bid

$7.81

$390.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$4.34 $217.00

$5.86 $293.00

no bid

no bid

107

Magnesium Sulfate
50% 5gm/10ml

40ea.

no bid

no bid

$0.84

$33.60

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid

$1.61 $64.40

no bid

no bid

108

Morphine Sulfate
4ma (4ma/mL)
1mL Carpuject
Blunt

100ea

no bid

no bid

$1.43

$143.00

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid

$1.01 $101.00

no bid

no bid

109

Naloxone HCL

2ma (Ima/mL)
2mL Min-1-Jet
syringe

100ea.

no bid

no bid

$10.44

$1,044.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$10.36 $1,036.00

$1.29 $129.00

no bid

no bid

110

Nitrolingual Spray
60 metered dose

50ea.

no bid

no bid

$69.50

$3,475.00

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid

$121.34 $6,067.00)

no bid

no bid

Promethazine
(25ma/mL)
1mL ampule

50ea.

no bid

no bid

$1.95

$97.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$1.69 $84.50

$2.54 $127.00

no bid

no bid

112

Tetracaine 0.5%
Opthalmic Solution

15mL bottle

25ea

no bid

no bid

$2.60

$65.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$2.92 $73.00]

$3.45 $86.25

no bid

no bid

113

Sodium Bicarb
injection, 8.4%
Adult

(ImEg/mL) 50mL
Stickguard syringe

50ea

no bid

no bid

$1.92

$96.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$3.35 $167.50

$3.58 $179.00

no bid

no bid

114

Thiamine
100mg/2ml

100ea

no bid

no bid

$5.57

$557.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$35.71 $3,571.00

$5.37 $537.00

no bid

no bid

115

Solumedrol 125mg
Act-O-Vial

50ea

no bid

no bid

$4.55

$227.50

no bid no bid

no bid

$5.75 $287.50

$4.66 $233.00

no bid

no bid

116

Vasopressin
20units/ml 1ml vial

100ea

no bid

no bid

$3.96

$396.00

no bid no bid

no bid

$6.74 $674.00

$3.76 $376.00

no bid

no bid




MEDICAL PRODUCTS

BOUNDTREE MEDICAL,

INTERBORO

SOUTHEASTERN

TRI-ANIM HEALTH

HENRY SCHEIN MATRX

SUPPLY LLC PACKAGING CORP EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT SERVICES, INC. MEDICAL MOORE MEDICAL QUAD MED, INC.
Item # Description Est. Unit Ext Cost Unit Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost
oTY Cost Cost
117 [Vecuronium 100ea
Bromide bid bid $6.15 $615.00|no bid bid bid $3.47 $347.00 $3.02 $302.00]no bid bid
10ma/10m! vial no bi no bi . .00]no bi no bi no bi . . d .00no bi no bi
118 [Midazolam
(Versed) 10mg
(5ma/mL)
2mL Vial 100ea [no bid no bid $3.26 $326.40]no bid no bid no bid no bid $2.57 $257.00no bid no bid
119 |Zemuron 50 ea
(Rocuronium
Bromide) : : . . . . . .
. no bid no bid $18.625 $931.25]no bid no bid no bid no bid $16.17 $808.50]no bid no bid
20ma/Smlvial
120 |Zofran 200ea
(Ondansetran) bid bid $3.500 $700.00]no bid bid bid $1.50 $300.00 $23.83|  $4,766.00|no bid bid
4mg/2mi vial no bi no bi 85| 700.00fno bi no bi no bi 1.5l . . 4,766.00]no bi no bi
121 |D5W 250cc 36/1cs lcs . . . . . . .
no bid no bid $71.28 $71.28]no bid no bid no bid $33.60 $33.60 $32.05 $32.05|no bid no bid
122 |Oral Airways 1 bx/ ea
B Il si
(Berman) (all sizes) nobid o bid $0.20 $0.20]no bid no bid
$0.37 $0.37]no bid no bid $0.15 $12.00] $13.50 $13.50 $7.01 $7.01 $1.61 $1.61 $1.05 $1.05
123 [Nasal Airways (all | 2 bx/ea . . . .
sizes) no bid no bid $22.90 $45.80fno bid no bid $2.55 $180.00 $17.70 $35.40 $15.71 $15.71 $13.05 $26.10| $14.08 $28.16)
124 |Endotracheal 2bx/ea . . i i
tubes (uncuffed) no bid no bid $12.60 $25.20fno bid no bid $0.65 $180.00 $9.20 $18.40 $10.61 $21.22 $1.00 $1.00 $9.71 $19.42
125 |Endotracheal 2bx/ea . . i i
tubes (cuffed) no bid no bid $12.70 $25.40fno bid no bid $0.95 $104.50 $9.80 $19.60] $10.81 $21.62 $1.06 $1.06 $10.59 $21.18
126 ]Combi Tube Kits 25ea . . i i
Req Adult no bid no bid $44.36 $1,109.00fno bid no bid $40.75 $1,018.75 $71.39 $1,784.75 $40.63 $1,015.75] $42.06 $1,051.50 $44.00 $1,100.00
127 |Easy Ca;-) 1l 1lcs  |no bid no bid $252.24 $252.24]no bid no bid $8.80 $211.20 $354.96 $354.96 $238.33 $238.33 $58.68 $58.68 $210.00 $210.00
128 |PediCap I 1lcs  |no bid no bid $252.24 $252.24]no bid no bid $8.80 $211.20 $354.96 $354.96 $59.95 $59.95] $58.68 $58.68 $210.00 $210.00
129 |Lubricating Foil 1bx . . . .
packets no bid no bid $8.51 $8.51]no bid no bid $5.10 $5.10 $4.18 $4.18 $3.70 $3.70 $3.34 $3.34 $6.32 $6.32
130 Saction Canisters lcs . . i i
(1200cc) (Bemis) no bid no bid $128.64 $128.64]no bid no bid $2.45 $117.60 $108.48 $108.48 $126.25 $126.25 $120.48 $120.48 $100.32 $100.32
131 ]Yankaeur Sucti-on lcs . . i i
Tip no bid no bid $42.00 $42.00fno bid no bid $0.55 $27.50 $22.50 $22.50 $51.01 $51.01] $20.00 $20.00] $18.00 $18.00
132 ]Suction tubing lcs . . . . . .
(9/32" X 6 no bid no bid $63.00 $63.00fno bid no bid no bid $48.00 $48.00] $48.51 $48.51] $64.00 $64.00fno bid
133 [Salem Sump Tube
8fr 30ea |no bid no bid $7.95 $238.50]no bid no bid no bid $7.14 $214.20 $1.82 $54.60]no bid no bid
12fr 50ea |no bid no bid $2.57 $128.50]no bid no bid no bid $1.94 $97.00 $1.84 $92.00]no bid $1.90 $95.00
16fr 50ea |no bid no bid $2.57 $128.50]no bid no bid no bid $1.96 $98.00 $2.14 $107.00fno bid $1.90 $95.00
134 |Soft tip suction
catheter
8fr 50ea [no bid no bid $0.55 $27.50fno bid no bid $0.20 $10.00 $0.29 $14.50 $0.36 $18.00] $0.33 $16.50] $0.29 $14.50]
12fr 50ea [no bid no bid $0.46 $23.00fno bid no bid $0.20 $10.00 $0.29 $14.50] $0.35 $17.50] $0.33 $16.50] $0.29 $14.50]
16fr 50ea [no bid no bid $0.46 $23.00fno bid no bid $0.20 $10.00 $0.29 $14.50] $0.35 $17.50] $0.33 $16.50] $0.29 $14.50]
135 |Thomas Tube
Tamer
Adult 2cs  |no bid no bid $297.00 $594.00]no bid no bid $2.75 $550.00 $265.00 $530.00 $286.01 $572.02 $301.00 $602.00 $321.00 $642.00
Pedi lcs  Ino bid no bid $297.00 $297.00]no bid no bid $2.75 $275.00 $265.00 $265.00 $286.01 $286.01 $301.00 $301.00 $341.00 $341.00
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136

Alcare Hand
Sanitizer (alcohol
foam)

72ea

no bid

no bid

$9.88 $711.36

no bid no bid

$9.00 $648.00

$7.98 $575.56

$4.89 $352.08

$6.68 $480.96

$6.30 $453.60

137

Stethoscope
(Littman Classic II)

20ea

no bid

no bid

$72.79 $1,455.80

no bid no bid

$38.00 $760.00

$69.00 $1,380.00]

$56.77 $1,135.40]

$54.20 $1,084.00

$62.40

$1,248.00

138

Vasopressin
20units/mL_Vial

40ea

no bid

no bid

$3.96 $158.40

no bid no bid

no bid

$6.74 $269.60

$3.76 $150.40

no bid

no bid

139

Adult Combo Pads
(LP 12 compatible)

100ea

no bid

no bid

$20.71 $2,071.00

no bid no bid

$23.95 $2,395.00

$21.17 $2,117.00

$16.18 $1,618.00

no bid

no bid

140

Pedi Combo Pads
(LP 12 compatible)

20ea

no bid

no bid

$20.71 $414.20

no bid no bid

$17.50 $350.00

$21.17 $423.40

$23.51 $470.20

no bid

no bid

141

Melker Cric Kit
cuffed Spec OPS-
C-TCCSB-500-
SPOPS

25 ea

no bid

no bid

$149.47 $3,736.75

no bid no bid

$136.75 $3,418.75

no bid

$159.44 $3,986.00

no bid

no bid

142

Cooks Emergency
Pneumothorax kit

25ea

no bid

no bid

$79.04 $1,976.00

no bid no bid

$64.40 $1,610.00

no bid

$77.90 $1,947.50

no bid

$69.18

$1,729.50

143

Gripper Needle by
Smiths 19gauge X
linch

25ea

no bid

no bid

$9.5375 $238.44

no bid no bid

$44.70 $89.40

no bid

$8.65 $216.25

no bid

no bid

144

Bougie ET tube
introducer
(disposable)

no bid

no bid

$5.58 $558.00

no bid no bid

$4.95 $495.00

$3.84 $384.00

$4.69 $469.00

no bid

no bid

145

Ear and ulcer
syringe
Mediline#DYND70
275

25ea

no bid

no bid

$0.93 $23.25

no bid no bid

no bid

$0.57 $14.25

$0.65 $16.25

no bid

$0.65 $25.00

146

Cold packs
(disposable)
5.5"X8”

150ea

no bid

no bid

$0.5066 $75.99

no bid no bid

$0.38 $57.00

$0.38 $57.00

$0.27 $40.50

$0.92 $46.00

$0.50 $75.00

147

Hot packs
(disposable) 6'X9”

100ea

no bid

no bid

$0.5716 $57.16

no bid no bid

$11.85 $47.40

$0.55 $55.00

$0.28 $28.00|

$0.46 $46.00

$0.58 $58.00

148

“SAM” Splint
(41/47x36")
12/case

6cs

no bid

no bid

$83.52 $501.12

no bid no bid

$9.10 $655.00

$77.64 $465.84

$76.33 $457.98

$7.40 $532.80

$122.40

$734.40

149

Fasplint Kit
(Hartwell Medical)
ES9000

Sea

no bid

no bid

$213.19 $1,065.95)

no bid no bid

$198.90 $994.50

$196.00 $980.00

$182.94 $914.70

$106.30 $531.50

$200.95

$1,004.75)

150

Fasplint Small
FS801

2cs

no bid

no bid

$84.10 $168.20

no bid no bid

$15.15 $151.50

$75.80 $151.60

$70.76 $141.52

$14.38 $28.76

$79.00

$158.00

Fasplint Medium
FS802

2cs

no bid

no bid

$101.15 $202.30

no bid no bid

$19.50 $195.00

$91.80 $183.60

$85.69 $171.38

$16.83 $33.66

$98.00

$196.00

152

Fasplint Large
FS803

3cs

no bid

no bid

$149.65 $448.95

no bid no bid

$27.20 $408.00

$135.80 $407.40

$126.76 $380.28

$24.90 $74.70

$144.00

$432.00

153

Fasplint compact
pump FS12C

4ea

no bid

no bid

$117.47 $469.88

no bid no bid

$108.00 $432.00

$112.00 $448.00

$100.81 $403.24

$33.00 $132.00

$121.00

$484.00

154

Fasplint Tapered
Adapter FS15TIP

6ea

no bid

no bid

$7.99 $47.94

no bid no bid

$7.20 $43.20

$8.10 $48.60

$6.73 $40.38

no bid

$9.25 $55.50

155

Ferno Traction

Splint Adult

Sea

no bid

no bid

$213.72 $1,068.60

no bid no bid

$250.00 $1,250.00

$137.64 $688.20

$206.49 $1,032.45]

$142.88 $714.40

$250.80

$1,254.00




MEDICAL PRODUCTS|BOUNDTREE MEDICAL, INTERBORO SOUTHEASTERN TRI-ANIM HEALTH HENRY SCHEIN MATRX
SUPPLY LLC PACKAGING CORP EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT SERVICES, INC. MEDICAL MOORE MEDICAL QUAD MED, INC.
Item # Description Est. Unit Ext Cost Unit Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost
oTY Cost Cost
156 JFerno Traction Sea . . X X
Splint Pedi no bid no bid $213.72 $1,068.60fno bid no bid $250.00 $1,250.00 $137.64 $688.20 $207.89 $1,039.45 $142.88 $714.40 $250.80 $1,254.00
157 Fe:w Pedi-Pac S5ea
(Pedi Back Board) ) ) . A .
no bid no bid $198.93 $994.65]no bid no bid $264.00 $1,320.00 $299.00 $1,495.00 $251.05 $1,255.25[no bid $263.12 $1,315.00
158 [Morris Swivel 50ea
Speed Clip 5’ B/B . . . .
Straps no bid no bid $8.86 $443.00]no bid no bid $10.35 $103.50 $10.05 $502.51 $8.34 $417.00 $10.25 $512.50 $9.85 $492.50
159 |7.25" Trauma 40ea . . X X
Shears no bid no bid $2.00 $80.00]no bid no bid $0.95 $38.00 $0.91 $36.40 $0.84 $33.60 $2.00 $80.00 $0.89 $35.60
160 |Disposable 100ea _ _ ] ]
Penlights no bid no bid $0.875 $87.50]no bid no bid $0.65 $65.00 $0.68 $68.00 $0.75 $75.00 $4.15 $70.55 $3.90 $390.00
161 jSam Sling Pelvic 20ea . . X X .
Sling (medium) no bid no bid $58.06 $1,161.20fno bid no bid $49.50 $990.00 $49.40 $988.00 $44.81 $896.20]no bid $60.00 $1,200.00
GRAND TOTAL| $8,253.75] $103,149.99 $3,380.00 $73,561.55 $85,179.89 $94,559.37 $65,082.15 $62,487.12
Drug exchange program N/A yes N/A no no yes no no response
Percentage off catalog list price for
items not listed no 8% 50% 10% 10% 12% 16% no response
Willing to be secondary supplier Yes yes yes yes yes yes yes no response

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY
INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BIDS AS RESPONSIVE. THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN
PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS. INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND
ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.

PURCHASING DIVISION
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